REDFRXBEB N

e

KRR ERREBECHE  BRFEE (Cartel ) B 5 2EBW - BES
ZRRERT > EREERGE > HENEERENET - WERRZSREREEIE
LB o HRIFEE IR Z R —RIAEE N/ ERERI RS » R
B ERREEHERRERN 8B 5 EEFMERIEEL TR - ARBEAHFHE
BT (F LR R S L MR R BT SR E R R » DIBCEERSEREEE
{tEHEBEMt - BTHREFEEREES » EEP 1948 FIZE T Monopolies and Re-
strictive Practice Act ( F 5 KBHEITE ) °

TR AR

19734 Fair Trading Act

19744F Prices Act

19754E Prices Act

19767 Resale Prices Act

1976%F Restrictive Trade Practice Act

19775E Restrictive Trade Practice Act

19774 Price Commission Act

19804F Competition Act

19805 % F % ( Competition Act ) f X B E

Section
1 Abolition of Price Commission

Control of anti-competitive practices

Anti-competitive practices

Preliminary investigation by Director of possible anti-competitive practice
Undertakings in consequence of Director’s reports

Competition references

Scope of competition references

Supplementary provisions as to competition references

Conclusions and reports of the Commission

Undertakings following report on competition reference

Nalie RN Be SRV I 7 I



10

11
12
13

15

16
17
18
19

20

21
24

25
26
27

29
30

Orders following report on competition reference
Further references and investigations

References of public bodies and certain other persons to the Commission
Orders following report under section 11
Investigations of prices directed by Secretary of State

Patents and agricultural schemes
Agricultural schemes : special provisions
General provisions about references and investigations

General provisions as to reports

Laying before Parliament and publication of reports
Information and advice about operation of Act
Restriction on disclosure of information

Grants
Power to make grants to certain bodies
Amendments of Fair Trading Act 1973

Monopoly references by Secretary of State alone
Modification of provisions about performance of Commission’s functions

Amendments of Restrictive Trade Practices Act 1976

Suspension of declarations under section 1 ( 3 ) of Restrictive Trade
Practices Act 1976 pending appeals

Suspension of declarations under section 1 ( 3 ) of Restrictive Trade
Practices Act 1976 pending revision of agreements

Recommendations by services supply associations

Exemption of certain undertakings from Restrictive Trade Practices Acts
Exemption of copyright agreements from Restrictive Trade Practices Acts



Supplementary

31 Orders and regulations
32 Financial provisions
33 Short title, interpretation, repeals, commencement and extent

SCHEDULES
Schedule 1—Supplementary provisions in connection with dissolution of Price
Commission

Schedule 2—Enactments repealed



<

ERERAREER R L BIERRE » ENEEARERERECHR  UF
KREE G 2B > RAPEICRFRAERGRIE  RESEERIFEPRIE
» FERIAE— /N NOE » FEhT ( trust ) FIHBNZEARIERS - B INE T FERIHTROIE
o WRENITEERAERE ] > MEERENESBHERER » PETE1889FE
18914E] - 2 BUNBUR I E R FEhi eI » RMNEREERE EYNERIZ BT
5 BURFSBURFAE 18904 1 5ek5E “ Sherman Act ” » MR 1914FH1E “ Clayton
Act” B “ Federal Trade Commission Act ” * W= ERET ENRIENITER
o IAFE1914E LI EEGHIE T HEFEKHEARERREEBIHE

HARBE A

18904 Sherman Act

19144F Clayton Act

1914%F Federal Trade Commission Act

19365 Robinson Patman Act

19378 Miller-Tydings Act

19384F Wheeler Lea Act

19504 Celler-Kefauver Act

19755 Magnuson-Moss FTC Improvement Act

19765 Hart-Scott-Rodino Antitrust Improvements Act

19765 Sherman Anti-trust Act

19904 Sherman Act

1990£F Sherman Act A2 %
An Act
Entitled the “ Antitrust Amendements Act of 1990 ” .

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of
America in Congress assembled, That this Act may be cited as the “ Antitrust
Amendments Act of 1990 ” .

SEC. 2. Section 8 of the Clayton Act ( 15 U.S.C. 19 ) is amended to read as
follows :

“SEC. 8. (a) (1) No person shall, at the same time, serve as a director or
officer in any two corporations ( other than banks, banking associations, and trust
companies ) that are—

“ ( A) engaged in whole or in part in commerce 5 and



“ (B) by virtue of their business and location of operation, competitors,
so that the elimination of competition by agreement between them would
constitute a violation of any of the antitrust laws »

if each of the corporations has capital, surplus, and undivided profits aggregating
more than $ 10,000,000 as adjusted pursuant to paragraph (5 ) of this
subsection .

“ (2) Notwithstanding the provisions of paragraph (1) , simultaneous
service as a director or officer in any two corporations shall not be prohibited by
this section if—

“ ((A) the competitive sales of either corporation are less than
$ 1,000,000, as adjusted pursuant to paragraph (5 ) of this subsection »

“ ( B) the-competitive sales of either corporation are less than 2 per
centum of that corporation’s total sales 5 or

“ ( C) the competitive sales of each corporation are less than 4 per centum
of that corporation’s total sales.

For purposes of this paragraph, ‘ competitive sales’ means the gross revenues for
all products and services sold by one corporation in competition with the other,
determined on the basis of annual gross revenues for such products and services in
that corporation’s last completed fiscal year. For the purposes of this paragraph,
total sales > means the gross revenues for all products and services sold by one
corporation over that corporation’s last completed fiscal year.

“ (3) The eligibility of a director or officer under the provisions of paragraph

(1) shall be determined by the capital, surplus and undivided profits, exclusive
of dividends declared but not paid to stockholders, of each corporation at the end of
that corporation’s last completed fiscal year.

“ (4) For purposes of this section, the term ° officer ° means an officer
elected or chosen by the Board of Directors.

“ (5) For each fiscal year commencing after September 30, 1990, the
$ 10,000,000 and $ 1,000,000 thresholds in this subsection shall be increased ( or
decreased ) as of October 1 each year by an amount equal to the percentage
increase ( or decrease ) in the gross national product, as determined by the
Department of Commerce or its successor, for the year then ended over the level so
established for the year ending September 30, 1989. As soon as practicable, but
not later than October 30 of each year, the Federal Trade Commission shall publish
the adjusted amounts required by this paragraph.

“ (b ) When any person elected or chosen as a director or officer of any
corporation subject to the provisions hereof is eligible at the time of his election or
selection to act for such corporation in such capacity, his eligibility to act in such



capacity shall not be affected by any of the provisions hereof by reason of any
change in the capital, surplus and undivided profits, or affairs of such corporation
from whatever cause, until the expiration of one year from the date on which the
event causing ineligibility occurred. ”

SEC. 3. Section 10 of the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C. 20 ) is hereby repealed.
AMENDMENTS

SEC. 4. (a) RESTRAINT OF TRADE AMONG THE STATES.—Section 1
of the Sherman Act (15 U.S.C. 1)is amended—
(1) by striking “one million dollars” and inserting “ $ 10,000,000”, and
(2) by striking “one hundred thousand dollars” and inserting “ $ 350,000 .
(b) MONOPOLY .—Section 2 of the Sherman Act (15 U.S.C. 2) is
amended—
(1) by striking “one million dollars” and inserting “ $ 10,000,000”, and
(2) by striking “one hundred thousand dollars” and inserting “ $ 350,000 .
(c) OTHER RESTRAINTS OF TRADE .—Section 3 of the Sherman Act (15
U.S.C. 3) is amended—
(1) by striking “one million dollars” and inserting “ $ 10,000,000”, and
(2) by striking “one hundred thousand dollars” and inserting “ $ 350,000”.

TREBLE DAMAGES FOR THE UNITED STATES

SEC. 5. Section 4A of the Clayton Act (15 U.S.C. 15a) is amended by
striking out “actual” and inserting in lieu thereof “threefold the”.
Approved November 16, 1990.

2EEH .

LATR GBI R ERES M 587.19/4003

2 BBINT RGBTSR R582.908/2178

3T GhiEHEm  587.19/5733

4 EERNTRBEAHBRERIR  587.19/2178

5.Antitrust law and economics in a nutshell 343.73072/G318

6.Antitrust economics : mergers, contracting and strategic behavior 347.30372/

W731



7.Economic analysis and antitrust law 343/C167
8.European/American antitrust and trade law 343.072/E89



